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TO: Acting County Manager 

GENERAL SERVICES 

Office of Purchasing 

FROM: Michael Westerman, Purchasing Manager ~ 

DATE: April 12, 2016 

SUBJECT: Award of Bid #2637 - Annual Emulsified Oil 

The purpose of this bid is to establish an annual requirements contract to purchase 
three different types of emulsified oil for annual testing with the intent to select a 
primary group. Each group will be used during a calendar year in the chip seal road 
surface treatment process completed by Public Works Road Crews in the rural 
areas of Clark County to seal the surface from moisture infiltration. 

Purchasing received two responses to Bid #2637. The bids were checked for 
accuracy, content, and compliance to specifications . 

Purchasing and Public Works recommend that Annual Emulsified Oil be awarded 
annually by group with the total annual amount not to exceed any one group 
including Washington State Sales Tax as follows: 

1. Albina Asphalt: 
a. Group 1 - $1,070,700.00 
b. Group 3 - $1,070,700.00 

2. Blue Line Transportation Company Inc.: 
a. Group 2 - $1, 158,400.00 

Mark McCauley, Acting County Manager Date Approved 
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OPENING DATE: 5-Apr-16 AWARD DATE: 12-Apr-16 . . BID NUMBER: 2637 

Albina Asohalt Blue Line Transportation Co, Inc. 

ANNUAL EMULSIFIED OIL 
"; '1g 

801 Main Street 2606 N Newark St. 
Vancouver, WA 98660 / Portland, OR 97217 ' 

DESCRIPTION TONS UNIT PRICE TOTAL QTY UNIT PRICE TOTAL QTY UNIT PRICE TOTAL 

GROUP1 

CRS-2P emulsified oil 2600 369.50 $960,700.00 2600 368.00 $956,800.00 

CSS-lH Dilute emulsified oil 550 200.00 $11 0,000.00 550 220.00 $121,000.00 

TOTAL BASE BID $1 ,070, 700.00 $1 ,077,800.00 

GROUP2 

CRS-3P emulsified oil 2600 No Bid 2600 399.00 $1 ,037,400.00 

CSS-l H Dilute emulsified oil 550 No Bid 550 220.00 $121 ,000.00 

TOTAL BASE BID $1 , 158,400.00 

GROUP3 

HFRS-P2 emulsified oil 2600 369.50 $960,700.00 2600 No Bid 

HFE-90-15 Dilute emulsified oil 550 200.00 $110,000.00 550 No Bid 

TOTAL BASE BID $1 ,070, 700.00 

Bid prices shall remain fi rm for a period of 12 months? YES YES 



Balogh, Beth 

From: Oman, Carl 
Sent: 
To: 
Cc: 

Tuesday, April 05, 2016 3:41 PM 
Westerman, Mike; Balogh, Beth 
Strauch, Mike 

Subject: FW: Bid #2637 
Attachments: SM FCPU R116040514460.pdf 

Hi Beth and Mike, 

It is my recommendation that Clark County awards (Group 1 and 3) to Albina Asphalt based on the total base bid 
amount in each group so we don't have to split up the CRS-2P and CSS-lH Dilute with two suppliers. I would award 
(Group 2) to Blue Line Transportation. If for any reason we have a problem in the future with product or service we can 
look to rebid the contract versus extending the current bid for another year up to four years. 

Thanks for your work on this, 

Carl Oman 
Public Works Operations Superintendent 
4700 NE 78th Street 
Vancouver, WA 98665 
(360) 397-2446 Ext. 1621 
(360) 759-6916 Fax 
Carl.Oman@clark.wa.gov 

From: Balogh, Beth 
Sent: Tuesday, April 05, 2016 2:47 PM 
To: Oman, Carl 
Cc: Westerman, Mike 
Subject: Bid #2637 

Hi Carl, 

Here are your copies of the bids that were turned in today. 
You will need to send a recommendation to Mike and me by Thursday afternoon. 

Albina is already calling. Thanks! 

!J)etft 9Jafuglt 
Clark County Purchasing 
(360) 397-2323 
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