
OPENING DATE:           5-Apr-16 AWARD DATE:             12-Apr-16 BID NUMBER: 2637

Albina Asphalt Blue Line Transportation Co, Inc.
ANNUAL EMULSIFIED OIL 801 Main Street 2606 N Newark St.

Vancouver, WA  98660 Portland, OR  97217
DESCRIPTION TONS UNIT PRICE TOTAL QTY UNIT PRICE TOTAL QTY UNIT PRICE TOTAL 

GROUP 1
CRS-2P emulsified oil 2600 369.50 $960,700.00 2600 368.00 $956,800.00

CSS-1H Dilute emulsified oil 550 200.00 $110,000.00 550 220.00 $121,000.00

TOTAL BASE BID $1,070,700.00 $1,077,800.00

GROUP 2
CRS-3P emulsified oil 2600 No Bid 2600 399.00 $1,037,400.00

CSS-1H Dilute emulsified oil 550 No Bid 550 220.00 $121,000.00

TOTAL BASE BID $1,158,400.00

GROUP 3
HFRS-P2 emulsified oil 2600 369.50 $960,700.00 2600 No Bid

HFE-90-1S Dilute emulsified oil 550 200.00 $110,000.00 550 No Bid

TOTAL BASE BID $1,070,700.00

Bid prices shall remain firm for a period of 12 months? YES YES
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